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PRIVACY PROVISIONS 
 
 
The information requested in this application form and your academic record will be used 
solely for the purposes of assessing your application for the Scholarship(s) for which you are 
applying. Personal information contained in this application will be made available to members 
of the Selection Committee for this award, the membership of which is detailed in the award 
regulations.  
 
Lincoln University will store your application in a secure place in the event that you are 
successful in gaining an award or are selected as a reserve candidate for an award, and to 
destroy your application to preserve its confidentiality in the event that you are unsuccessful 
in gaining an award. 
 
Should you have reason to believe that information held about you in either your application 
or your academic record is incorrect, you have the right of access to, and correction of, that 
information. 
 
Personal references from the persons you have named are obtained on the strict 
understanding that they are confidential, and you may not have access to those reports 
without the written authorisation of the author. 
 
 
I, ............................................................................................ agree to the above conditions with 
respect to my scholarship application(s) to Lincoln University. 
 
 
Signed:........................................................…………...  
 
Date:....................................................... 

 
 
 

ADVICE TO APPLICANTS 
 
 
Applications must arrive by the date shown on the application form. No undertaking is given 
to accept late applications. 
 
It is your responsibility to contact your referees, and ask them to send their references to the 
Scholarships Office.  References should be clearly marked with your name and the name of 
the scholarship(s) for which you are applying.  Referees should not be asked to send their 
references to you, as they must have the opportunity to be completely frank.  Non receipt of 
referees reports or incomplete applications may prejudice your eligibility.  
 
If Official documents are requested as part of your scholarship application please do not send 
original documents. Send only copies that have been certified by a J.P, a solicitor, or a staff 
member in the university registry.  Unless specifically requested, please do not send a 
curriculum vitae.  Lincoln
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